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Abstract 

Logistics are not only playing a significant role in the business process, but they can also add value to the 

business, and even also determine the life of the firm. Due to its significance, the advancement of logistics is 

inevitable. Customers want everything faster, and they are even willing to pay more for the service. This study 

provides an empirical investigation of instant courier service customers in Indonesia. A total of 300 valid 

questionnaires were collected from the millennial that already had an experience in using Go-Send in greater 

Jakarta as a respondent and assessed using structural equation modelling (SEM). The results showed that 

perceived service quality influences customer satisfaction and trust. On the other hand, logistics service 

innovation influences perceived service quality but not customer satisfaction. While trust affects customer 

satisfaction and repurchase intention. Moreover, customer satisfaction influences repurchase intention. This 

study is one of the first to evaluate and confirm the relations of service quality-repurchase intention in instant 

courier service. This research contributes to the literature for future research in instant courier service by 

providing empirical evidence in Indonesia. 

Keywords— Customer Satisfaction; Logistics Service Innovation; Perceived Service Quality; Repurchase 

Intention; Trust 

 

Abstrak 

Logistik tidak hanya memainkan peran utama dalam proses bisnis, tetapi juga dapat menambah nilai bagi bisnis, 

dan bahkan juga menentukan kehidupan perusahaan. Karena signifikansinya, kemajuan logistik tidak dapat 

dihindari. Pelanggan menginginkan segalanya lebih cepat, dan mereka bahkan bersedia membayar lebih untuk 

layanan ini. Penelitian ini memberikan investigasi empiris pada pelanggan layanan kurir instan di Indonesia. 

Sebanyak 300 kuesioner yang valid dikumpulkan dari para milineal yang memiliki dalam menggunakan Go-

send di Jakarta sebagai responden dan dinilai menggunakan Structural Equation Modelling (SEM). Hasil 

penelitian menunjukkan bahwa persepsi kualitas layanan mempengaruhi kepuasan dan kepercayaan pelanggan. 

Di sisi lain, inovasi layanan logistik memengaruhi persepsi kualitas layanan, tetapi bukan kepuasan pelanggan. 

Sementara, kepercayaan memengaruhi kepuasan pelanggan dan niat pembelian kembali. Selain itu, kepuasan 

pelanggan mempengaruhi niat pembelian kembali. Studi ini adalah salah satu yang pertama untuk mengevaluasi 

dan mengkonfirmasi hubungan niat pembelian kembali dengan kualitas layanan dalam layanan kurir instan. 

Kontribusi, implikasi praktis, dan batasan penelitian dibahas.s 

Kata kunci— Customer Satisfaction; Logistics Service Innovation; Perceived Service Quality; Repurchase 

Intention; Trust 

 

I. INTRODUCTION  

Logistics is not only able to add value and becoming a vital factor in business activity, but also determine the 
success of a firm. The research on logistics has been conducted since the 1940s and focuses on mechanization 
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(e.g., pallets and pallet lift) to improve the material handling process and to maximize space usage. However, 
the focus changed and widened in the 1950s with the development of intermodal transportation management 
(Robinson, 2018).  Logistics nowadays has to become a massive industry with a revenue value of USD 8138.46 
billion in 2015 and expected to be USD 15522.02 billion by 2023 (PRNewswire, 2016). The compound annual 
growth of all logistics segments from 2014 to 2018 is also showing a stable increase; postal delivery 0.6%, air 
transport 2.1%, sea transport 2.2%, road transport 4.6%, and rail transport 5.4% (Statista Research Department, 
2016).    

The logistics industry is a big influence on a country’s economic situation since it can improve the economy 
through many factors. It creates employment, generates national income, foreign investment influx, and 
increases the competitive capability of the corporation (Sezer & Abasiz, 2017).  For instance, in Indonesia, 
logistics play a crucial role in connecting the coffee farmers all over Indonesia to coffee shops in Bandung 
which benefitted both parties and developed their business (Anggadwita, Profityo, Permatasari, Alamanda, & 
Hasfie, 2019). Many aspects have supported the logistics industry in Indonesia, for instance, population 
consumption, infrastructure development, and foreign investment. This resulted in a steady growth of the 
industry, as Frost & Sullivan, an international consulting company predicted, there will be an increase of 15.4% 
by 2020 with the value of IDR 3.396 trillion (Motoris, 2018). Though the industry seems to show a flourishing 
development, logistics in Indonesia is still facing a crucial problem. According to the Ministry of Public Works 
and Housing of Republic Indonesia, the logistics costs are quite high, which reaches 24% of GDP, while other 
countries are below 15% or even 10% (Prabowo, 2019).  

The logistics and E-commerce industry is supporting each other. On the one hand, logistics will help the 
ecosystem of E-Commerce, and on the other hand, with the massive development of E-Commerce, the logistics 
industry will be affected as well. E-Commerce growth in Indonesia is predicted to have a market value of USD 
47,067 million by 2023 (Statista, 2019). With 195 million smartphone users in Indonesia and 30 active million 
shoppers, the potential growth is enormous and requires a new development of logistics (Bisara, 2019). One of 
the new trends which are currently on the rise in digitalization or also called smart logistics, which creates more 
convenience for the consumer and enables personalization for online order, payments, and even tracking (PWC, 
2019). In Indonesia, many companies have embraced the new innovation, started from the big companies like 
DHL, JNE, and J&T, and even startup companies like Ninja Express, Grab, and Gojek (Setyowati, 2018; Nabila, 
2019). 

The immense change in the logistics industry increased consumer expectation, get the goods faster, more 
flexibility, transparency, and low price (Tipping & Kauschke, 2018). It reported that almost 25% of young 
consumers are willing to pay more to get the product on the same day of the order or get an instant delivery 
(Joerss, Neuhaus, & Schroder, 2016). Instant courier or same-day delivery is delivering the goods within few 
hours after the order has been made, and it has been the catalyst for online sales (Hausmann, Herrmann, Krause, 
& Netzer, 2014).  There are many players in instant courier services, for instance, Ninja Express, Deliveree, 
Gojek, and Grab. However, Gojek and Grab are the two giant online transportation companies that cause a 
threat to both existing and new players in the business of instant delivery due to their cheaper fee and massive 
resource of hundreds of thousands of drivers (Global Business Guide Indonesia, 2017). As for the overall value, 
Go-Jek has reached 50 trillion Rupiah with active riders of 1 million, and it is now spreading its wings on 
Vietnam. In contrast, Grab has achieved around more than 80 trillion Rupiah in the South East Asia market even 
before Uber acquisition with estimated active riders around 2 million (Paskalis, 2018). Although Grab has more 
valuation and active riders, in the local Indonesian market, Go-Jek is still dominating, as stated by Indonesian 
Business Competition Supervisory Commission (KPPU), the market share of Go-Jek reaches almost 80% 
(Aditiasari, 2018). 

Instant courier delivery systems promised various features that can lead to an increase in perceived service 
quality, such as convenience, accuracy, and safety, which are loved by millennials generation (Sun, 2015). 
Supposedly they are delivering the services of the elements. However, dissatisfaction from the consumer comes 
from either product that does not arrive at the estimated time or product is damaged, and there is a connection 
between the improvement of operational performance and customer satisfaction (Bouzaabia, Bouzaabia, & 
Capatina, 2013). Moreover, Indonesian Consumer Protection Foundation (YLKI) requests that the logistics 
service providers should guarantee that the items should have arrived safely to the customer because some crime 
cases through courier services, especially Go-Send, lead to the loss of goods delivered, even though the tracking 
system shows that the goods have been picked up by the courier and just waiting for the goods to arrive, but the 
item in question never arrived (Agung, 2017). 

There are numerous studies on service quality that are based on the theory found by Parasuraman, Zeithaml, 
and Berry (1985). Studies on various logistics industry have also been done, for instance in manufacturers’ 
satisfaction on logistic service (Saura, Frances, Contrı, & Blasco, 2008), courier service (Vaalei, Rezaei, & 
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Shahijan, 2016), and third-party logistics outsourcing relationships (Juga, Juntunen, & Grant, 2010). However, 
the study on service quality of same-day delivery service in logistics is still limited and has not been conducted 
in Indonesia. Thus, this study provides an insight into the importance of service quality in delivering customer 
satisfaction, which resulted in the customer repeat purchase. Furthermore, this research analyzes the influence of 
logistic service innovation, perceived service quality, customer satisfaction, and trust towards millennials’ 
repurchase intention on instant courier services 

This research consists of four sections. The first section begins with the explanation on the foundation of 
theoretical on logistic service innovation, perceived service quality, customer satisfaction, trust, and repurchase 
intention, which based on the previous studies. Section 2 explains the research model of the study, hypothesis, 
research design, and sampling methods. The third section discusses the result of the research, which includes 
validity, reliability, model fit, and hypothesis testing. Discussion from the finding, conclusion, and implication 
for further research are presented in the last section. 

 

II. HYPOTHESIS DEVELOPMENT 

A. Perceived Service Quality  

Perceived service quality has been used by Parasuraman in 1988, which is comparing what customers expect 
and their perception after experiencing the service (Dlačić, Arslanagić, Kadić-Maglajlić, Marković, & Raspor, 
2014). Service quality or SERVQUAL has five dimensions of the concept, which are tangibility, reliability, 
responsiveness, assurance, and empathy (Parasuraman, Zeithaml, & Berry, 1985).  Another definition by 
Parasuraman (1985), service quality is highly determined by the expectation of the customer and their opinion of 
the service that is delivered (Noor & Saad, 2016). A recent study regarding the perceived service quality stated 
that for the courier services dimensions of service quality is called “CouQual,” which includes promptness, 
tangibility, accuracy, safety, and convenience (Vaalei, Rezaei, & Shahijan, 2016). The promptness is a part of 
the service quality by Parasuraman (1985). It includes the responsiveness dimension of SERVQUAL (Brochado 
& Pereira, 2017). Tangibility can be defined as one of the aspects of service quality that can be felt by the 
customers without them buy the services (Panda & Das, 2014). Accuracy refers to the estimated time when it 
comes to courier services, either it is shorter or longer than the expected (Vaalei, Rezaei, & Shahijan, 2016). 
Safety is a dimension that is constructed within the five SERVQUAL dimensions (Hussain, Al Nasser, & 
Hussain, 2014). A convenience is a form of time and service efficiency by customers while buying products or 
enjoying the services (Roy, Shekhar, Lassar, & Chen, 2018). 

Service quality has played an essential role in marketing and logistics research, and it has been identified to 
successfully improved customer satisfaction as the critical key, this leads to repurchase intention of products or 
services (Saura, Frances, Contrı, & Blasco, 2008). Service quality is one of the crucial factors to be discussed in 
compliance behaviour because it is related directly to customer satisfaction (Noor & Saad, 2016). If the 
customers assess the after-consumption positively, it is more likely their satisfaction levels and their ability or 
availability to repurchase will increase (Han & Hyun, 2015). SERVQUAL is being determined as one of the 
most effective measurements for examining service quality (Vaalei, Rezaei, & Shahijan, 2016). The previous 
study about logistic service quality stated that service quality has a positive and significant link to customer 
satisfaction (Bouzaabia, Bouzaabia, & Capatina, 2013). 

A previous study in China regarding the e-retailing and its logistics showed that there is a strong relationship 
between service quality and the customer satisfaction in China e-retailing and logistics (Subramanian, Yu, 
Gunasekaran, & Cheng, 2014). Perceived service quality has a direct influence on customer satisfaction on the 
user’s intention to use transportation again (de Oña, de Oña, Eboli, Forciniti, & Mazulla, 2016). A study about 
the Location Based Services (LBS) discussed when the services providers offer their services. The customer 
may put their trust and expectation of their satisfaction to those service providers (Wang & Lin, 2016). Service 
delivery quality has a strong relationship with trust in gaining customers through e-banking services (Kao & 
Lin, 2016). 

B. Logistic Service Innovation  

Logistics service innovation can go from the basic model one to more complex and can be applied in a range 
of internal operations and or service within business partners (Cichosz, Goldsby, Knemeyer, & Taylor, 2017). 
The use of technologies such as RFID, EDI, and logistics programs such as managing vendor, cross-docking, 
etc. are part of logistics innovation, including the role of the entire logistics operation and its management 
(Grawe, 2009). The logistics innovation has been identified as a new kind of logistics service that is helpful for 
the related consumer (Flint, Larsson, Gammerlgaard, & Mentzer, 2005). 
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The overview of the recent research from the scholars has been researching the logistic services innovation. 
Their primary focus is on factors affecting the logistics service innovation. At the same time, there is also 
research regarding the logistic innovation model and path for the logistics services that are a critical part of 
online shopping transactions in the customer point of view and evaluation, thus impacting repurchase intention 
in e-commerce (Lin & Zhang, 2015). Combining customers into the innovation process may increase the chance 
of customer satisfaction and improve the innovation performance of the logistics service (Cichosz, Goldsby, 
Knemeyer, & Taylor, 2017). For logistic services, the more serious relations suggest higher client satisfaction, 
and fewer relationships suggest lower client satisfaction (Bellingkrodt & Wallenburg, 2015). Service delivery is 
part of service innovation that impacting in customer behavioural intention, which includes the repurchase 
intention (Su, 2011; Bao, Li, Shen, & Hou, 2016). 

The previous study regarding the logistics innovation stated that the innovations of service would increase 
the performance of the service quality and its efficiency in developing new products (Rajahonka & Bask, 2016). 
Furthermore, engaging the customers into the process of logistics service innovations could lead into intense 
customer satisfaction and increase the innovation of logistics service provider performance (Cichosz, Goldsby, 
Knemeyer, & Taylor, 2017). 

C. Customer Satisfaction  

Customer satisfaction is a psychological feeling when the initial customer expectation and perceived 
performance meet in the centre, together with the customer needs’ (Oliver, 1980). Satisfaction is defined as 
customers’ affective response to the experience in doing online shopping transaction (Wallace, Gieses, & 
Johnson, 2004). There are two different kinds of satisfaction, namely, satisfaction towards website and 
satisfaction towards the seller. When shopping online, the satisfaction of the site indicates the affective response 
of experience in doing online shopping. In contrast, the satisfaction towards the seller suggests the response of 
experience in doing the purchasing of products from the sellers (Wallace, Gieses, & Johnson, 2004). According 
to Giese and Cote (2000), satisfaction is a reaction, whether it is emotional or cognitive. The response itself 
relates to specific interests such as desires, product or services, experience, and it happens at a particular time, 
such as after the decision, utilization, or accumulated experience (Cichosz, Goldsby, Knemeyer, & Taylor, 
2017). 

According to Parasuraman (1985), the connection between the service quality standards and customer 
standards may deduct the gap of the service performance and increased the value of the service itself, which 
directly impacts on customer satisfaction (Kundu & Datta, 2015). Previous research has been done in the 
internet service banking area. It stated that the customers are most likely satisfied when the service performance 
is beyond expected, and it makes the customer trust the service (Amin, 2016). In the context of customer-
technology content interaction, showed that there is a strong connection between service quality and customer 
satisfaction (Orel & A., 2014). The previous study has proven through the empirical data that the relationship 
between the experience of the customer's satisfaction and the repurchase intention have favourable action to it 
(Pappas, Pateli, Giannakos, & Chrissikopoulos, 2014). 

D. Trust 

Trust has been defined as the beginning of the relationship, and as an exchange in several contexts, it is the 
core point of the relationship (Harris & Goode, 2004). Trust also can be viewed as a set of confidence beliefs 
that can give a positive contribution of willingness to make a transaction in the online environment (Hart & 
Dinev, T., 2006). Trust can be defined as an expectation that the others do not have, and the seller is providing 
the products as promised (Al-Debei, Akroush, & Ashouri, 2015). 

When a customer wants to make the repurchase decision, usually they do it because of their direct prior 
experience that they needed to choose whether they will do the repurchase intention with the same seller or not 
(Kim, 2008). Trust or distrust can be led from familiarity after product consumption, in which it is only in 
repurchase situations and can be considered as a major source of trust (Ba & Pavlou, 2002). According to Mayer 
(1995), when the level of trust outperforms the limit of apparent risk, at that point, the trustor will participate in 
the risk-taking event such as repurchase decision (Fang, Qureshi, Sun, & Mccole, 2015). The previous study 
about online retailer stated that the better service quality of a website influences the level of trust of a customer 
(Al-Debei, Akroush, & Ashouri, 2015). In the online customer’s case, trust decreases the barrier between 
uncertainty in repurchase intention and the risk (Bao, Li, Shen, & Hou, 2016). Besides, Permatasari and 
Kartikowati (2018) suggested increasing the information design value and visual design to improve customer 
trust in e-commerce. 

A consumer behavior study stated that consumers want satisfaction to be loyal to the seller or the service 
providers, and trust apparently becomes a part of customer satisfaction (Chinomona & Dubihlela, 2014). The 
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previous study by Teo and Liu (2007) said that trust decreases the risk and the uncertainty involved in doing the 
repurchase of products or services. It minimizes the gap between buyers and sellers and increases the chance of 
repurchase intention from the customers. Concluding that trust has a positive relationship with the repurchase 
intention (Bao, Li, Shen, & Hou, 2016). 

E. Repurchase Intention 

Repurchase intention can be defined as a personal achievement of maintaining a relationship with the service 
provider and purchase the same service (Kitapci, Akdogan, & Dortyol, 2014). The implication of repurchase 
intention has been evolving through years, and it is considered as a consumer behaviour outcome in which 
resulting in a high level of satisfaction and loyalty (Dlačić, Arslanagić, Kadić-Maglajlić, Marković, & Raspor, 
2014). Besides, repurchase intention has been known as a potential strategy for services marketing for 
maintaining the customers, less cost rather than attracting the new one, and more profitable for the long term 
(Saleem, Zahra, & Yaseen, 2017).  When a customer wants to make the repurchase decision, usually they do it 
because of their direct prior experience that needed to choose whether they will do the repurchase intention with 
the same seller or not (Kim, 2008). Customers who are satisfied tend to do the repurchase intention while the 
unsatisfied one will discontinue the use; this has been proved in previous research (Chiu, Lai, Chang, & Hsu, 
2012). Additionally, Permatasari and Kuswadi (2017) suggested maintaining the relationships with the customer 
in various ways, including via social media, to increase the company value and repurchase intention. 

Service providers keep on using the resources to identify and utilize the number of factors that is related to 
repurchase intention, particularly service quality and customer satisfaction. Satisfaction is in the influencing 
factor of the repurchase intention (Chiu, Lai, Chang, & Hsu, 2012). Service quality has played an essential role 
in marketing and logistics research, and it has been identified to successfully improve the customer satisfaction 
as the critical key in which leads to repurchase intention of products or services (Saura, Frances, Contrı, & 
Blasco, 2008). In the repurchase intention context, trustworthiness has been identified as a direct transaction 
between sellers and buyers in which the buyers able to re-examine it by experience-based and acknowledge the 
sellers by their trustworthiness (Fang, Qureshi, Sun, & Mccole, 2015). Expectation Confirmation Theory (ECT) 
in their context of marketing strategy stated that customer satisfaction is a crucial variable for customers' 
repurchase intention (Pappas, Pateli, Giannakos, & Chrissikopoulos, 2014). 

Based on the above explanation in this conceptual framework, the following hypotheses and research 
framework are as follow: 

H1: Perceived Service Quality significantly influences customer satisfaction 

H2: Perceived Service Quality significantly affects trust 

H3: Logistics service innovations significantly influences Perceived Service Quality 

H4: Logistics service innovations significantly influence customer satisfaction. 

H5: Trust significantly affects customer satisfaction. 

H6: Customer satisfaction significantly influences repurchase intention. 

H7: Trust significantly influences repurchase intention. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Figure 1. Research Framework  (Source: Chou, 2014; Lin and Zhang, 2015; Vaalei, Rezaei, and 

Shahijan, 2016. 
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III. RESEARCH METHODS 

A. Research Design 

This research is conducted to observe the millennial's repurchase intention towards instant courier services in 
greater Jakarta. The logistics service innovation is the independent variable. The perceived service quality, 
customer satisfaction, and trust are the mediating variables, while the repurchase intention is the dependent 
variable. Operational definition of variables consists of several questions and combined with being a construct 
measurement. From the dependent variable, which is repurchase intention, the mediating are perceived service 
quality and its dimensions (promptness, accuracy, safety, tangibility, and convenience), customer satisfaction, 
trust, and the last one is the independent variable, logistics service innovation. Each variable has five items of 
measurement, exclude the perceived service quality because the dimension each has five items of measurement, 
which make a total of 35 item measurements are made for this research.  

This research is using an online-based questionnaire as a platform to collect all the data needed. Even though 
the online-based questionnaire can be wrongly targeted, however, it can be filtered through a screening question. 
The screening question is made in the first section or at the beginning of a questionnaire in order to examine 
whether the respondents are qualified or eligible to be a part of the research (FluidSurvey Team, 2013). If the 
respondent has answered “true” to the screening questions, means that the respondents are qualified for this 
research and may continue to the next question which is related to demographic such as age, gender, school, 
salary and after that have to fill the questions related with the variables. The questionnaire shared with other 
people via social media.  

The questionnaire is adapting the 6-Point Likert Scale, which 1 represents “Strongly Disagree,” and 6 
represents “Strongly Agree.” The reason for using a 6-point Likert Scale is because it is suitable for research 
that used several variables, and it does not have so many numbers of items that will burden the respondents 
(Chomeya, 2010). Not only make it more valid and reliable, but the 6-Point Likert Scale also helps the 
researcher to make the respondents commit to either positive or negative choice (Gwinner, 2011). The 6-point 
Likert scale consists of “Strongly Disagree,” “Moderately Disagree,” “Slightly Disagree,” “Slightly Agree,” 
“Moderately Agree,” and “Strongly Agree” (Brown, 2010). Since this research is using the Structural Equation 
Model (SEM), the statistical software is used to get a descriptive analysis of the data (University of South 
Australia, 2018). Structural Equation Model (SEM) is used to show the causal relationships between variables. 
Besides, SEM is mostly used for a study that is designed to confirm a research design, which means that the 
research is focused on the strength of the relationships between each variable in a hypothesis (Devault, 2018). 

B. Population and Sampling 

The population is every complete group with at least one thing in common of characteristics within that 
group (Australian Bureau Statistics, 2018), and for this research, the population is the people who live in greater 
Jakarta. The sample of this research is being determined only for millennials. Millennials are people who were 
born in 1980 to the mid of 1990s or even early 2000 (Johnstone, 2018) and already had an experience in using 
Go-Send in greater Jakarta. These criteria are made in order to fulfil the requirements of this research. As for the 
sampling techniques, this research is using non-probability sampling because it is non-randomized methods to 
collect the sample. The minimum size of the sample of 200 and 300 respondents is recommended to perform a 
significant analysis, especially in assessing the consumerism and buying behaviour (Malhotra, 2010; Pallant, 
2010; Gbadamosi, 2016). The questionnaires that were given to the respondents were 400 questionnaires. After 
five days of spreading the questionnaires, the researcher gathered around 380 respondents, but the valid 
respondents were 300. 

The questionnaire is from the previous researcher but disseminated through Google Form, which makes it 
easier to spread widely to get the sample. It was spread using a link through Instant Messenger such as 
WhatsApp, Line, and through social media like Instagram, Facebook, and Twitter. Furthermore, the respondents 
are also able to share the link to their contacts to fill the questionnaire as well. After the data is collected, it was 
downloaded in excel format from Google Form and then exported into the statistical software to analyze the 
validity, reliability, and AMOS for the hypothesis testing. 
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Table 1. Sample Characteristic (N=300) 

  Characteristic Frequency Percent 

1 Age 18-20 61 20.33% 

  21-25 222 74.00% 

  25-30 11 3.67% 

  30-28 6 2.00% 

2 Occupation Employee 210 70% 

  Freelancer 71 23.67% 

  Entrepreneur 14 4.67% 

  Others 5 1.66% 

3 Income < IDR 1.000.000 58 19.33% 

  IDR 1.000.000 – 5.000.000 190 63.33% 

  IDR 5.000.000 – 10.000.000 41 13.67% 

  > IDR 10.000.000 11 3.67% 

4 Instant Courier Service Use 
Frequency 

More than once a month 76 25.33% 

  Once a month 96 32.00% 

  Once within 3 months 68 22.67% 

  Once within 6 months 60 20.00% 

5 Reason using instant courier 
service 

Personal Needs 170 56.7% 

  Online Shopping 111 37.00% 

  Professional Needs 16 5.3% 

  Others 3 1.00% 

 

C. Data Analysis 

Descriptive analysis is strict only to a particular group of populations observed, and the data that is being 
described is only for a certain group. In contrast, the inferential analysis is being analyzed by statistical tests in 
order to see the instruments that are being observed happen due to intervention or chance (University of 
Minnesota, 2018). Validity can be defined as a measurement in the quantitative study to prove which concept is 
accurate in the research; there are two types of construct validity, which are convergent and discriminant 
validity (Heale & Twycross, 2015). Convergent validity is supported if correlations between variables are high 
or significant, while the discriminant validity is supported if correlations between variables are low or not 
significant (Nova Southeastern University, 2018). When using statistical software, three criteria needed to be 
passed. The KMO-MSA & Bartlet test should be (≥ 0.5); communalities extraction should be greater than 0.5, 
and the Total Variance should be at least 60% (Anastasiadou, 2011). The reliability test is used to measure the 
consistency of the variables being measured (Ye, Abbas, Hussain, & He, 2018). The current research stated that 
internal consistency is defined by alpha, and if the score is close to 1, the construct is reliable or if the 
Cronbach's Alpha 0.762, then the instrument is reliable (Heale & Twycross, 2015).  

As this research is using statistical software, there are several factors of analysis of the statistical software to 
be used. The C-MIN should be lower than 5, the RMSEA should be smaller than 0.08, the IFI, TLI, CFI should 
be higher or equal to 0.9, and the last one AGFI, GFI should be higher or equal to 0.8 to fulfil the requirement of 
Model Fit in statistical software (Shadfar & Malekmohammadi, 2013). Meanwhile, for the hypothesis, to be 
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accepted p-value should be less than 0.05 (p<0.05), and the critical ratio should be higher than 1.96 (Abedi, 
Rostami, & Nadi, 2015). 

 

IV. RESULT AND DISCUSSION 

A. Construct Validity 

To test the validity of the data, the KMO (Kaiser-Meyer-Olkin) and Bartlett were used to test the validity 
(Sarstedt & Mooi, 2014). The KMO for the independent variable and mediating variable, which are Logistics 
Service Innovations and Perceived Service Quality, is 0.906, which means it is accepted because the KMO 
criteria should be higher or equal to 0.5. Moreover, the Bartlett result is showing the significant value of 0.000, 
where the Bartlett criteria should be lower or equal to 0.05. The Total Variance Explained (TVE) value is 
67.928 or 67.9%, where the TVE should be higher or equal to 60% (Hair, Black, Babin, & Anderson, 2014). 
The Communalities Value for the independent variables is above 0.4. The same thing goes to Rotated 
Component Matrix; all the values for the independent variables are higher than 0.4. Therefore, based on the 
criteria above for the validity of the Logistic Service Innovations and Perceived Service Quality are valid. The 
result of the validity test of the independent and mediating variable can be seen in Table 2. 

As for the dependent and mediating variable, which are Customer Satisfaction, Trust, and Repurchase 
Intention, the KMO value is 0.949 whereas the KMO criteria should be higher or equal to 0.5, while the Bartlett 
result is showing the significant value of 0.000, where the Bartlett criteria should be lower or equal to 0.05. The 
Total Variance Explained for the dependent variable is showing the value of 72.563%. The Communalities 
Value and Rotated Component Matrix both are exceeding 0.4. Therefore, both the mediating variable and 
dependent are valid. The result of the validity test of the dependent variable can be seen in Table 2. 

For the reliability test, since this research is using a statistical tool to process the data. The Cronbach’s α is 
being used as the basis to get the reliability data. Here, the result shows that all the variables are exceeding the 
criteria value, which is 0.762. The perceived service quality got 0.886 for the Cronbach’s α, the logistics service 
innovations Cronbach’s α value is 0.869, customer satisfaction got 0.907, while trust got 0.871 and the last one, 
repurchase intention got 0.909 for its Cronbach’s α. Through this data, it can be concluded that all the variables 
are passing the reliability standard. The result of both validity and reliability tests of all variables can be seen in 
Table 2. 

Table 2. Validity and Reliability Test Results 

Factor KMO and 
Bartlett’s 
Test 

Rotated 
Component 
Matrix 

Communalities Total 
Variance 
Explained 

Reliability 

Perceived Service Quality .906; .0001 .602 .517 67.928 0.886 

PSQ11  .747 .663   

PSQ12  .795 .720   

PSQ13  .786 .641   

PSQ14  .809 .686   

PSQ15  .826 .701   

Logistic Service Innovation  .830 .726  0.869 

LSI2  .850 .779   

LSI3  .828 .731   

LSI4  .731 .629   

Customer Satisfaction .949; .0001 .731 
.712 

72.563 0.907 

CS2  .798 
.785 

  

CS3  .714 
.708 
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Factor KMO and 
Bartlett’s 
Test 

Rotated 
Component 
Matrix 

Communalities Total 
Variance 
Explained 

Reliability 

CS4  .706 
.696 

  

   
 

  

CS5  .746 
.734 

  

Trust  .568 
.606 

 0.871 

TR2  .819 
.711 

  

TR3  .715 
.724 

  

TR4  .744 
.758 

  

TR5  .567 
.664 

  

Repurchase Intention  .753 
.760 

 0.909 

RI2  .782 
.759 

  

RI3  .774 
.801 

  

RI4  .775 
.771 

  

RI5  .692 
.695 

  

   
 

  

B. Structural Model 

After all measurement models have been indicated valid and reliable, the next step is to analyze the 
structural model. In testing the structural model, model fit and its indices, along with the structural relationship, 
and hypothesis testing are conducted. Based on Table 3, the overall model fit for the research is a good model. It 
can be indicated through the RMSEA value, which is 0.057, and it is lower than 0.08. The CMIN/DF yields a 
value of 1.969, which is lower than 5.0. The IFI, TLI, CFI are .954, .945, .953 which exceed 0.9. The last one, 
AGFI, with the value of .848 and GFI with the value of .880, the values exceed the criteria, which is 0.8 or 
higher. Therefore, the test suggests that the model is a good fit to the data. 

Table 3. Model Fit and Quality Indices 

Model Fit Criteria Cut-Off Criteria* Research Result Interpretation 

Chi-Square 0.005 .000 Significant 

CMIN/DF ≤ 5.00 1.969 Good Fit 

Tucker Lewis Index (TLI) 0 ≤ x ≤ 1 .945 Good Fit 

Comparative fit Index (CFI) 0 ≤ x ≤ 1 .953 Good Fit 

Normed Fit Index (NFI) 0 ≤ x ≤ 1 .910 Good Fit 

Inferential Fix Index (IFI) 0 ≤ x ≤ 1 .954 Good Fit 

Root Mean Square Error of 
Approximation (RMSEA) 

0.05 ≤ RMSEA ≤0.1 .057 Good Fit 

Goodness of Fit Index (GFI) 0.5 ≤ GFI ≤ 1 .880 Good Fit 

Adjusted GFI (AGFI) 0.5 ≤ AGFI ≤ 1 .848 Good Fit 

*Source: Hair, Babin, Anderson, and Black (2018) 

C. Hypothesis Testing 

Once the model fit has been tested, the next step is to evaluate the structural relationships and also 
hypothesis testing. As for the hypothesis, it is being accepted if the p-value is less than 0.05 and the critical ratio 
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is more than 1.96 (Hair, Babin, Anderson, & Black, 2018), the research result can be seen in Table 4. H1 
demonstrating a positive relationship of perceived service quality and customer satisfaction was supported with 
a CR value of 2.921and a standard error of 0.0001. H2 is indicating a positive influence of perceived service 
quality towards trust (CR: 10.456, p-value < 0.001) as well as H3 proposing the significant influence of logistics 
service innovations towards perceived service quality (CR: 8.512, p-value < 0.001) were supported. 
Additionally, H5 showed the significant influence of trust towards customer satisfaction is supported (CR: 
5.483, p-value < 0.001). The same result also showed by H6, which proposed a significant influence of customer 
satisfaction towards repurchase intention (CR: 5.641, p-value < 0.001), as well as H7 which indicated the 
significant influence of trust towards repurchase intention (CR: 3.736, p-value < 0.001) were both supported. 
Interestingly, H4 proposing the influence of logistics service innovations towards customer satisfaction (CR: 
8.512, p-value < 0.001) was not supported.  

Table 4. Hypothesis Testing 

Hypothesis Path C.R. P-Value Interpretation 

H1 Perceived Service Quality → Customer 
Satisfaction  

2.921 .003 Supported 

H2 Perceived Service Quality → Trust 10.456 *** Supported 

H3 Logistics Service Innovations → Perceived 
Service Quality 

8.512 *** Supported 

H4 Logistics service innovations → Customer 
Satisfaction. 

1.141 .254 Not Supported 

H5 Trust → Customer Satisfaction. 5.483 *** Supported 

H6 Customer satisfaction → Repurchase 
Intention. 

5.641 *** Supported 

H7 Trust → Repurchase Intention. .102 3.736 Supported 

 

D. Discussion 

Based on the hypothesis testing that has been done, a total of six hypotheses are accepted or have 
significantly influenced the variable. At the same time, there was one hypothesis not accepted or has no 
significant influence on the variable. The first hypothesis of this research is “there is a significant influence of 
perceived service quality towards customer satisfaction.” Based on the hypothesis testing, it shows that the 
perceived service quality has significantly influenced customer satisfaction. This hypothesis result is being 
supported by Subramanian, Gunasekaran, Yu, Cheng, & Ning (2014) that there is a strong relationship between 
perceived service quality and customer satisfaction. Also, this hypothesis is supported by de Oña, de Oña, Eboli, 
Forciniti, & Mazulla (2016), who stated perceived service quality directly positively influenced customer 
satisfaction. Furthermore, the overall service quality and its overall dimensions, such as promptness, 
convenience, tangibility, accuracy, and safety of Go-Send services, have been proven to influence customer 
satisfaction. For example, e-commerce has teamed up with Go-Send to increase value for e-commerce like 
Lazada and make it easier for the customer (Maulana, 2016). 

The second hypothesis is “there is a significant influence of perceived service quality towards trust.” Based 
on hypothesis testing, the second hypothesis is accepted, and it means that perceived service quality has 
significantly influenced the trust. The study by Wang and Lin (2016) showed that the perceived service quality 
has positively influenced the trust. Another study by Kao and Lin (2016) also stated that perceived service 
quality directly influenced trust. The third hypothesis is “there is a significant influence of logistics service 
innovations towards perceived service quality.” The third hypothesis is accepted, and it means that the logistics 
service innovations have significantly influenced the perceived service quality. This hypothesis is being 
supported by a study from Rajahonka and Bask (2016), stated that the innovations of service increased the 
performance of service quality and its efficiency. The logistic service innovation that instant courier service 
providers used, such as the live tracker, has influenced the service performance and its service quality to support 
the delivery (Agung, 2017). 

The fourth hypothesis is “there is a significant influence of logistics service innovations towards customer 
satisfaction.” Based on the hypothesis testing, this hypothesis is rejected because the critical ratio is less than 
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1.96, and the p-value is more than 0.05, which is 0.254. This hypothesis is supported by a study by 
Fatkhurrohman (2011). The study found that service innovation did not directly influence customer satisfaction. 
Another study by Lee (2012), stated that there is no direct relationship between service innovation and customer 
satisfaction. There is a case regarding logistics service innovations, and it is related to customer satisfaction. 
One of the logistic service innovations that instant courier providers offer is the live tracker, where the customer 
can track the courier through the application. Some crime cases through courier services, and lead to the loss of 
goods delivered. Even though the tracking system shows that the goods have been picked up by the courier, the 
item never arrives (Agung, 2017). 

The fifth hypothesis is “there is a significant influence of trust towards customer satisfaction.” From the 
hypothesis testing result, this hypothesis is accepted and means that trust has significantly influenced customer 
satisfaction. A supporting study from Chinomona and Dubihlela (2014) stated that trust is influencing customer 
satisfaction and becomes part of it. To increase the customer satisfaction level, instant courier service providers 
have joined with several small and medium-sized enterprises through iSeller, where it can reach the customers 
who want to buy from a small retailer with instant delivery services (Sutriyanto, 2018). The sixth hypothesis is 
“there is a significant influence of customer satisfaction towards repurchase intention.” From the hypothesis 
testing result, this hypothesis is accepted and means that customer satisfaction has significantly influenced the 
repurchase intention. A supporting study from Pappas, Pateli, Giannakos, & Chrissikopoulos (2014) stated that 
there is a strong relationship between customer satisfaction and repurchase intention. The last hypothesis is 
“there is a significant influence of trust towards repurchase intention.” Based on the hypothesis testing result, 
this hypothesis is accepted, and it means that trust has significantly influenced the repurchase intention. The 
hypothesis has been supported by a study from Teo and Liu (2007), stated that trust had minimized the gap 
between buyers and sellers, and it is influencing the chance to repurchase. Furthermore, the study from Li., 
Shen, & F. (2016) concluding that trust has a positive relationship with the repurchase intention. Go-Send is also 
having some kind of promotion through Go-Points, which the customer can enjoy the promotion, and it will be 
announced weekly for the benefits, which drives the customer to use Go-Send more frequently to get the 
benefits (Haryanto, 2018). 

 

V. CONCLUSION 

The research analyzed the factors influencing customers in having repurchase intentions in instant courier 

service among millennials. The result indicated the importance of several factors in repurchase intention, 

namely perceived service quality, logistics service innovation, trust, and customer satisfaction. Out of 7 

hypotheses, there was only one hypothesis not supported. The hypotheses that are accepted are; There is a 

significant influence of perceived service quality towards customer satisfaction (H1), there is a significant 

influence of perceived service quality towards trust (H2), there is a significant influence of logistics service 

innovations towards perceived service quality (H3), there is a significant influence of trust towards customer 

satisfaction (H5), there is a significant influence of customer satisfaction towards repurchase intention (H6), and 

there is a significant influence of trust towards repurchase intention (H7). Meanwhile, the rejected hypothesis is 

there is a significant influence of logistics service innovations on customer satisfaction (H4). Furthermore, this 

research provides an insight into the importance of instant courier service both in business and also academic 

research through recommendations.  

A. Business Implication 

Based on the findings, there are two challenges faced by the instant courier service provider. The first one is 

to deliver customer satisfaction through service quality. Perceived service quality remains a crucial factor in 

influencing both trust and customer service, which leads to repurchase intention. There are several approaches 

that instant courier service providers can take to improve the perceived service quality. Firstly, the instant 

courier provider should offer and guarantee the safety of the package. Customer safety perception has been 

proven as a crucial factor in delivering customer satisfaction in the service industry (Rathert, May, & Williams, 

2011). To improve safety, instant courier providers should ensure the customer that their packages will be 

delivered in perfect shape without any defect. Thus, the instant courier service providers could install a box for 

the package instead of using a bag in their bikes, the box that is being used in food delivery so that the fragile 

stuff can be delivered safely.  

Furthermore, the research found that logistics service innovation does not influence customer satisfaction has 

been proven by several accidents of undelivered packages even though the customer can access the live tracker. 
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Therefore, the instant courier service provider should give the customer more assurance to reduce customer 

perceived risk. Hence, logistics service innovation should not only on the technology aspect or, in this case, the 

live tracker, but also other factors that may increase the continuous satisfaction. So and Sculli (2002) mentioned 

that providing more assistance, for instance, the ability to speak to a customer service representative for help or 

money-back guarantee is the possible solution for the company to build trust and even make the business 

sustainable. Moreover, McDoughall, Levesque, and Vanderplaat (1998) also stated that in-service guarantees, 

customers prefer to have a specific warranty when they consider invoking it due to its clarity and manifest 

nature.   

Also, with the advanced and robust development of E-commerce, the opportunity of the instant courier 

service providers to grow is tremendous. Therefore, the instant courier service provider should also consider in 

business expansion, and provide the service not only in big cities in the country. The development of business 

may lead to many positive effects, for instance, to give the impression of higher financial viability of the 

company, generate more sales, influence market price, and reduce competition risk (Invest Northern Ireland, 

2019).   Likewise, strong cooperation with E-commerce businesses is also highly recommended. Instant courier 

service providers should cooperate with the related e-commerce for the delivery system to set a standard if there 

is a sudden increase of order so that it is manageable for everyone, such as real-time tracking for sellers and 

buyers (Fajrian, 2017). 

B. Future Research 

Many factors are influencing the repurchase intention of customers. This study suggests future research to 

add other factors for the perceived service quality or change it into logistic service quality because this research 

proposed the dimension of perceived service quality such as promptness, safety, accuracy, convenience, and 

tangibility while there are other dimensions of logistic service quality such as timeliness, condition/accuracy of 

the order placed, information quality, and availability/quality of the courier personnel have been specified for 

the logistics services provider context (Chou, 2014). Due to limitations from this research, future research can 

also adopt more from other research. While this research focuses more on customer loyalty antecedents such as 

trust and perceived service quality, the future researcher may add new variables such as brand image and 

perceived value (Aydin & Özer, 2005). Moreover, this research only examined greater Jakarta. It is suggested 

that the future researcher can analyze the wider scope area or other instant courier services. 
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